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Vaccination rates have significantly decreased around the world from pre-COVID-19 
pandemic levels, according to a 2023 immunization coverage report released by the 
World Health Organization (WHO) and UNICEF last month. The report, released on 
July 14, 2024, is the world’s most extensive dataset on vaccination trends targeting 
14 diseases. This report analyzed estimates from 185 countries and used the third 
dose of the diphtheria, tetanus, and pertussis (DTP3) vaccine—recommended for 
one-year-olds—as the global benchmark for adequate vaccination coverage.1 

According to public health officials, the pandemic marked a “historic backslide” on 
routine childhood vaccines. Katherine O’Brien, MD, MPH, director of the 
Department of Immunization, Vaccines, and Biologicals at the WHO, said the 
current priority is to catch up on vaccinating children who missed their shots during 
the pandemic and to enhance vaccination coverage to surpass pre-pandemic 
standards.1 

Ninety Percent Global Vaccine Coverage Rate Goal Stalling 
The data showed that progress in returning to pre-pandemic vaccination levels has 
stagnated. In 2022 and 2023, global DTP3 coverage remained at 84 percent, below 
the 86 percent recorded in 2019. The new report also showed that the number of 
children who had not received a single dose of DTP3 increased by 600,000 from 
2022 to 2023. The authors of the report acknowledged that the findings represent a 
setback in achieving the Immunization Agenda 2030 goal of 90 percent coverage for 
routine childhood vaccines. As for the reason rates are stalling, the organizations 
cited disruptions in health care services, logistical challenges, vaccine hesitancy, and 
inequities in access to services in a press release.1 

Since April 2023, the WHO and UNICEF have collaborated with organizations like 
Gavi, the Vaccine Alliance and the Bill & Melinda Gates Foundation to further “The 
Big Catch Up” initiative, a response effort to combat the decline in vaccine coverage 
following the pandemic.1 

The United States saw its highest-ever reported increase in exemption rates last 
school year. During the 2022-23 school year, exemption rates increased in 41 states, 
leading to a national rise from 2.6 percent to 3 percent, with 10 states reporting an 
over five percent increase. Exemptions from school vaccine requirements differ by 
state. While public health laws in all 50 states provide for  medical exemptions 
granted by a medical doctor or doctor of osteopathy, 45 states and Washington, DC 
allow religious exemptions. Only 15 states still permit vaccine exemptions for 
personal, philosophical or conscientious beliefs.2 

Wider Distrust of “Authorities, Experts and Industries” During COVID 
Pandemic 
Dr. O’Brien noted that vaccine skepticism, which surged during the pandemic in 
wealthier countries, is partly to blame for the global decline. She alleged that 
migrants to wealthier European countries spread “misinformation” back to their 
home countries. However, Heidi J. Larson, PhD, professor of Anthropology, Risk & 



Decision Science at the London School of Hygiene & Tropical Medicine, suggested it 
may be inaccurate to blame “misinformation” for “vaccine hesitancy.” During the 
2019 Global Vaccine Summit, Dr. Larson commented, “We have a very wobbly health 
professional frontline that is starting to question vaccines and the safety of vaccines. 
[Social media platforms] have a lot of fingers pointing at them to fix the 
“misinformation” problem,” she said. “The biggest problem is, a lot of it is not 
misinformation.”1 3 4 

Larson continued, “Social media users may pose questions or instill doubt without 
saying something that is explicitly false. If someone asks, ‘Do you really know what’s 
in a vaccine?’ we cannot legally or ethically remove it. Getting the balance right 
between freedom of expression, privacy and public health is a major challenge. The 
erosion of public trust is part of a wider distrust of authorities, experts and 
industries.”5 

Vaccine Hesitancy a Major Problem in High Income Countries with 
Educated Populations 
A growing body of evidence indicates that wealthier, more informed families 
embracing holistic or alternative health practices comprise a significant portion of 
the vaccine-hesitant populations. According to a scientific study examining vaccine 
hesitancy, vaccine skepticism, which increased significantly during the COVID 
pandemic, is particularly prevalent among affluent or wealthy families. 

The study published in the American Journal of Preventive Medicine concluded 
that, “There are several studies indicating that vaccine hesitancy is a major problem 
in high-income countries, where lower rates of vaccine uptake have been found 
among the wealthiest children.” The survey suggested that the hesitancy stems from 
greater access to diverse information sources and a tendency towards holistic or 
alternative health practices. Study authors also speculated that wealthier individuals 
might also perceive a lower risk of infectious diseases and place a high value on 
individualism and personal choice, leading to resistance against established medical 
guidelines and vaccines.6 

 


